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52167 CRYSTAL P. PEACOCK, CCR 03/10/2022 1891
INVOICE # DATE PO # DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
03072022 3/7/2022 TRANSCRIPT 03.03.2022 SUPERIOR COURT 256.03
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Tammy L. Dukes

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Okay to pay. SP item.

John S, Myers

Tuesday, March 8, 2022 2:51 PM

Nancy A. Clark-Gonzalez; Tammy L. Dukes

Crystal Peacock

Fw: Hearing held 3-3-22 in Glynn County, GA before the Hon. Stephen G. Scarlett
johnmyerinvoice03072022.pdf

From: Crystal Peacock <crystalpeacock@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, March 7, 2022 5:34 PM

To: John S. Myers

Subject: Hearing held 3-3-22 in Glynn County, GA before the Hon. Stephen G. Scarlett

CAUTION: This email originated from outside your organization. Exercise caution when opening

attachments or clicking links, especially from unknown senders.
Attached is the invoice and transcript for the hearing held last week.
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I NVOICE

Invoice Date: March 7, 2022
Invoice Number: 03072022

Bill to:

Mr. John Myers

Camden County Attorney
P.O. Box 99

Woodbine, GA 31569

Description:

=Transcript of the Hearing held in Glynn County, on 3-3-22
before the Hon. Stephen G. Scarlett, Sr. - In Re: Camden County
v. Judge Robert C. Sweatt, Jr.., and Goodman/Harris as

Interested Parties.

Amount Due: 256.03

Approved by:

Please Remit Payment to:
Crystal Parker Peacock, CCR
93 Crystal Lane

Baxley, GA 31513

Thank you for your business!





